
TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS
Welcome to Wrapstyle Canada! These Terms and Con-
ditions („Terms“) outline the rules and regulations for the 
use of our website, www.wrapstylecanada.ca („Websi-
te“), operated by Wrapstyle  („Wrapstyle,“ „we,“ „us,“ 
or „our“). By accessing this Website, we assume you 
accept these Terms in full. Do not continue to use the 
Website if you do not accept all of the Terms stated on 
this page.

1. SERVICES OFFERED

Wrapstyle Toronto specializes in providing high-quality 
car wrapping, paint protection film installation, window 
tinting, and car detailing services („Services“). By using our 
Website, you agree to abide by the terms and conditions 
set forth herein regarding any Services booked through 
the platform.

2. BOOKING AND PAYMENT

To book any of our Services, you may need to provide 
personal and payment information. By booking a Service, 
you authorize Wrapstyle to charge your chosen payment 
method for the total amount due. Payment must be 
made in full before the scheduled appointment.

3. CANCELLATION AND RESCHEDULING

Should you need to cancel or reschedule your 
appointment, please notify us at least 24 hours in 
advance. Failure to do so may result in a cancellation 
fee. Wrapstyle reserves the right to cancel or reschedule 
appointments due to unforeseen circumstances, with 
every effort made to accommodate our clients.

4. CUSTOMER RESPONSIBILITIES

As our valued customer, you are responsible for 
providing accurate vehicle information and scheduling 
appointments at your convenience. Please ensure your 
vehicle is clean and free from debris before any Services 
are performed.

5. WARRANTY

We stand by the quality of our workmanship and wa-
rrant that Services will be performed with due care and 
skill. However, normal wear and tear or damage from 
improper vehicle use or maintenance are not covered 
under warranty. Any warranty claims must be made 
within the specified period and are subject to verifica-
tion by Wrapstyle.

6. INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY

All content and materials available on our Website, 
including text, graphics, logos, images, and software, 
are the property of Wrapstyle or its licensors and are 
protected by copyright and other intellectual property 
laws. You may not reproduce, modify, or distribute any 
content from the Website without prior written consent 
from us.

7. LIMITATION OF LIABILITY

To the fullest extent permitted by law, Wrapstyle shall not 
be liable for any indirect, incidental, special, consequen-
tial, or punitive damages arising from or related to the use 
of the Website or our Services. Our total liability shall not 
exceed the amount paid by you for the Services rendered.

8. GOVERNING LAW

These Terms are governed by the laws of Ontario, 
Canada, and any disputes arising out of or relating to 
these terms, or the use of the Website shall be subject 
to the exclusive jurisdiction of the courts of Ontario.

9. CONTACT INFORMATION

If you have any questions or concerns regarding these 
Terms or the Services provided by Wrapstyle, please 
don‘t hesitate to reach out to us at toronto@wrapstyle.
com or visit our physical location at 64 Sheffield Street, 
Toronto M6M 3E8, Canada.

10. CHANGES TO TERMS

Wrapstyle reserves the right to amend or modify these 
Terms at any time without prior notice. By continuing to 
use the Website after any revisions, you agree to be bound 
by the updated Terms. It is your responsibility to review 
these Terms periodically for any changes or updates.


